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Special advanced International Cultural Course
The special advanced international cultural course 
provides students with an extensive education.  Through 
the use of additional seventh period classes on 
Tuesdays and Thursdays, supplementary lessons, and 
outside learning opportunities such as international 
exchanges and overnight field trips, our students are 
provided with an education that delivers not only in 
quantity, but most importantly quality.  In addition to 
providing a curriculum that enables students to study 
abroad, we provide support those students wishing to 
enter highly selective Japanese national and private 
universities.

Cultural Course
Our curriculum meets each students individual needs, 
whether that is entering university or a specialized 
vocational school, studying abroad, or employment in a 
local company.  All students begin their studies on the 
same curriculum, but in their third year study, students 
are able to choose their own path of study from three 
different available curriculums; “Global”, “Academic” 
and “Career”.

Athletic Course
The Athletic Course is specifically designed for members 
of soccer, volleyball, kendo, softball, and track and field 
club.  This course creates an environment that enables 
students to help each other develop and improve their 
atheletic skills, and grow as individuals. 

HIMEJI INTERNATIONAL SCHOOL


